
SERVICE CATEGORY Description SUB-CATEGORY DESCRIPTION 
MSRP/List 

Price
(Per Unit)

Unit of 
Measure

Discount 
% off 
MSRP

DIR Customer Price
(Per Unit/EA)

WEBSITE DESIGN/DEVELOPMENT    e.g.  Website Design/Development Cat1  $       2,000.00 each 15.00% 1,712.75$               
   e.g.  Website Design/Development Cat2  $       3,000.00 each 20.00% 2,418.00$               
   e.g.  Website Design/Development Cat3  $       4,000.00 each 25.00% 3,022.50$               
Category Total Average Discount 20.00%

WEBSITE DESIGN/DEVELOPMENT Website Design/Development-S  $       1,000.00 Each 30.00% 705.25$                  
WEBSITE DESIGN/DEVELOPMENT Website Design/Development-L  $       2,000.00 Each 35.00% 1,309.75$               
WEBSITE DESIGN/DEVELOPMENT Website Design/Development-M  $       3,000.00 Each 35.00% 1,964.63$               
WEBSITE DESIGN/DEVELOPMENT Website Design/Development-C  $       4,000.00 Each 40.00% 2,418.00$               

-$                         
(Provide what is included in the above) Category Total Average Discount 35.00%

DOMAIN NAME SYSTEM (DNS) MANAGEMENT No Bid 0.00% -$                         
DOMAIN NAME SYSTEM (DNS) MANAGEMENT No Bid 0.00% -$                         

0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         

Category Total Average Discount 0.00%
(Provide any additional offering for DNS and price structure offering - e.g. one time, monthly fee, 
annual fee)

BUSINESS ANALYSIS SERVICES No Bid 0.00% -$                         
BUSINESS ANALYSIS SERVICES No Bid 0.00% -$                         
BUSINESS ANALYSIS SERVICES No Bid 0.00% -$                         

0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         

Category Total Average Discount 0.00%
(Provide any additional business tools offered and price structure offering - e.g. one time, monthly fee, 
annual fee)

WEBSITE HOSTING No Bid 0.00% -$                         
WEBSITE HOSTING No Bid 0.00% -$                         

0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         

Department of Information Resources
Request for Offer DIR-CPO-TMP-564

Comprehensive Web Development and Managed Services
Exhibit D - PRICING SHEET

COMPANY NAME: COOLSOFT LLC.

Upload the itemized PRICE SHEET in the BIDSTAMP VIS as an EXCEL spreadsheet

3. BUSINESS ANALYSIS SERVICES

4. WEBSITE HOSTING 

1. WEBSITE DESIGN/DEVELOPMENT

0-Sample Section 

2. DOMAIN NAME SYSTEM (DNS) MANAGEMENT

Page 1 of 3



SERVICE CATEGORY Description SUB-CATEGORY DESCRIPTION 
MSRP/List 

Price
(Per Unit)

Unit of 
Measure

Discount 
% off 
MSRP

DIR Customer Price
(Per Unit/EA)

0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         

Category Total Average Discount 0.00%
(Provide storage capacity, data transfer, support offered and any additional offering.  Include price 
structure offering - e.g. one time, monthly, annual fee)

CLOUD HOSTING No Bid 0.00% -$                         
CLOUD HOSTING No Bid 0.00% -$                         

0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         

Category Total Average Discount 0.00%
(Provide storage capacity, data transfer, support offered and any additional offering.  Include price 
structure offering - e.g. one time, monthly, annual fee, can not sell as stand alone, must be part of the 
Web Delvelopment solution)

E-MAIL HOSTING No Bid 0.00% -$                         
E-MAIL HOSTING No Bid 0.00% -$                         

0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         

Category Total Average Discount 0.00%
(Provide storage capacity and any additional offerings.  Include price structure offering - e.g monthly, 
annual fee)

ACCESSIBILITY SERVICES Compliance Development  $          125.00 Hourly 35.00% 81.86$                     
ACCESSIBILITY SERVICES Compliance Testing  $          125.00 Hourly 35.00% 81.86$                     

-$                         
-$                         
-$                         
-$                         
-$                         
-$                         
-$                         
-$                         

Category Total Average Discount 35.00%
(Provide services offered and pricing structure (e.g. monthly, hourly, reoccuring fees, blended rates, 
software, etc)

6. E-MAIL HOSTING

7. ACCESSIBILITY SERVICES

 5.  CLOUD HOSTING
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SERVICE CATEGORY Description SUB-CATEGORY DESCRIPTION 
MSRP/List 

Price
(Per Unit)

Unit of 
Measure

Discount 
% off 
MSRP

DIR Customer Price
(Per Unit/EA)

WEB CONTENT MANAGEMENT Website Content Management - (hourly)  $          125.00 Hourly 35.00% 81.86$                     
-$                         
-$                         

Category Total Average Discount 35.00%
(Provide services offered and pricing structure (e.g. monthly, annually, per page, per change, per hour, 
etc)

MAINTENANCE  Website Maintenance - (hourly)  $          125.00 Hourly 35.00% 81.86$                     
SUPPORT  Support - (hourly)  $          125.00 Hourly 35.00% 81.86$                     

-$                         
Category Total Average Discount 35.00%

  (Provide for each item above services offered and pricing structure)

TURNKEY SOLUTION No Bid 0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         

Category Total Average Discount 0.00%
(Provide turnkey solution that includes the above. Vendor should indicate which services is included  
in the turnkey solution.  Provide pricing structure - e.g. monthly, annually, etc)

BRAND NAME                                                              TYPE (hardware or Software etc.) SUB-CATEGORY DESCRIPTION  
MSRP/List 

Price
(Per Unit)

Unit of 
Measure

Discount 
% off 
MSRP

DIR Customer Price
(Per Unit/EA)

No Bid 0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         
0.00% -$                         

125

9. WEB TRAINING, MAINTENANCE, AND SUPPORT

10. TURNKEY SOLUTION

11. TURNKEY SOLUTIONS 3RD PARTY PRODUCTS (Signed letter of authorization must be submitted with Vendor’s proposal)
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